
Dear Commissioner Joh
ansson,

Please be informed that
 the Danish Governmen

t, in accordance with the
 pro-

visions in Article 25 and 
27 of Regilation (EU) 20

16 399 of 9 March 2016

(Schengen Borders Cod
e), has decided to tempo

rarily reintroduce border
controls at the intemal b

orders. The reintroductio
n of border control at the

Danish internal borders 
will be carried out for 6 m

onths as from 12 May
2022. The persistent and signi

ficant threat to our public
 order and internal secur

ity

caused by militant Islam
ists and organized crimin

als who are able to explo
it

the free mobility within th
e Schengen area contin

ues to be of grave conce
m

for the Danish Governm
ent.

It is the assessment of th
e Center for Terror Anal

ysis (CTA) under the Da
n-

ish Security and Intellige
nce Service that the terr

orist threat against Den-

mark continues to be se
rious. CTA assesses tha

t there may be individua
ls

among refugees and mig
rants arriving in Europe 

who can pose a terror

threat. Also, CTA assess
es that larger displacem

ent flows due to the Rus
sian

invasion of Ukraine on 2
4 February 2022, may re

sult in persons osing a

terror threat to Denmark
 using such flows to gain

 entry to Europe.

Further-more, the threat
 from organized criminal

s in Sweden towards De
n-

mark continues to raise 
serious concem.

Against this backdrop an
d after careful considera

tion, the Danish Govem-

ment considers the temp
orary intemal border con

trols as a necessary and
effective measure to add

ress these threats to pub
lic order and intemal sec

ur-
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ity and furthermore find
s that alternative meas

ures would not achieve
 the

same effect. The border control may
 extend to all internal b

orders, including land, 
sea

and air borders, where
by the specific border s

ections and border cros
sing

points are detemiined b
y the Danish National P

olice. However, the bor
der

control will focus on the
 Danish-German land b

order, the Danish-Swed
ish

land border (Øresunds
forbindelsen) and the D

anish ports with feny co
nnec-

tion to Gennany or Swe
den.

Please rest assured tha
t the scope of the intern

al border checks will co
ntinue

to be limited to what is 
deemed strictly necess

ary to respond to the th
reat to

our public order and int
emal security.

The Danish Governme
nt will notify the other M

ember States about thi
s de-

cision. Yours 'ncerely, H 313g


